
Angell, Thomas Graveley 1880 - 1956 

Thomas Graveley Angell was born in Kensington, London on 13 February 1880
and was articled to Arthur William Blomfield (1829-1899), Charles James Blomfield
(1862-1932) and Arthur Conran Blomfield (1863-1935) of A.W. Blomfield & Sons
from 1896 to 1903. He then worked as an assistant to Lewen Sharp (?-1914); to
Noel D. Sheffield (1878-1955); to Francis Albert Whitwell; to Charles Mèwes
(1860-1914) and Arthur Joseph Davis (1878-1951) of Mèwes & Davis; to John
Thomas Lee (1845-1920); and to Stodart, Pine, Griffin & Imrie.

In 1911 he was elected a Licentiate of the Royal Institute of British Architects
(LRIBA) and in c.1911 began practising as an architect in London. From c.1912 he
was in partnership with George Blair Imrie (1885-1952) as Imrie & Angell.   The
practice had an office at 2 Mitre Court Chambers, London. Angell died in
Buckinghamshire on 27 May 1956.

Worked in
UK
Works

See UK Modern House [link below] for a list of architectural projects by Imrie &
Angell
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• UK Modern House http://ukmoho.co.uk/html/architect/Imrie_Angell.html
• Wikipedia https://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/George_Blair_Imrie
• Historic England - West Ridge, Walpole Avenue, Chipstead, Coulsdon
https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1466683
• Historic England - The Lodge, 88 Kippington Road, Sevenoaks, Kent
https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1336383
• Historic England - Tifters, The Street, Charlwood, Surrey
https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1277829
• Historic England - Garage and Garage Flat, Kippington Road, Sevenoaks, Kent
https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1085970

https://architecture.arthistoryresearch.net/architects/angell-thomas-graveley
https://architecture.arthistoryresearch.net/architects/imrie-george-blair
https://architecture.arthistoryresearch.net/firms/imrie-angell
http://ukmoho.co.uk/html/architect/Imrie_Angell.html
https://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/George_Blair_Imrie
https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1466683
https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1336383
https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1277829
https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1085970


• Historic England - Royal Horticultural Society Offices, Wisley Gardens
https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1189118
• Historic England - Chipstead War Memorial
https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1441041
• Historic England - Churchill Court, Kippington Road, Sevenoaks, Kent
https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1336382
• Historic England - Royal Horticultural Society Gardens, Wisley
https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1000126
• Historic England - ‘Crow Clump’, ‘The Corbies’ and ‘Yaffle Hill’, Yaffle Road,
Elmbridge, Surrey https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1392383
• Dictionary of Scotish Architects 1660-1980
http://www.scottisharchitects.org.uk/architect_full.php?id=201617
• RIBA - Esher petrol station, Surrey https://www.ribapix.com/esher-petrol-station-
surrey_riba72803
• Country Life. Lost in the Surry [sic] Landscape
https://www.countrylife.co.uk/fresh-on-the-market/lost-in-the-surry-landscape-
57688

https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1189118
https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1441041
https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1336382
https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1000126
https://historicengland.org.uk/listing/the-list/list-entry/1392383
http://www.scottisharchitects.org.uk/architect_full.php?id=201617
https://www.ribapix.com/esher-petrol-station-surrey_riba72803
https://www.ribapix.com/esher-petrol-station-surrey_riba72803
https://www.countrylife.co.uk/fresh-on-the-market/lost-in-the-surry-landscape-57688
https://www.countrylife.co.uk/fresh-on-the-market/lost-in-the-surry-landscape-57688

